
  

* EVS in Local Development Agency* 
 

Personal Information

Name/Middle name/Surname

Date of birth (dd/mm/year)

Age

Place of birth (city/village, 
country)

Nationality

Permanent residence (address, 
postal code, city, country)

Current residence (address, 
postal code, city, country)

E-mail and skype contact 
information

 Telephone/mobile phone

To be reached best at (what 
time?)

Fax

Marital status Single
Married
Divorced
Other (please specify)

Passport number

Father's name/Mother's name

Brother's and sisters (name and 
age)

Name/Middle name/Surname 
of person to notify in case of 

emergency

Telephone (home) of person to 
notify in case of emergency



Telephone (office) of person to 
notify in case of emergency

Telephone (mobile) of person to 
notify in case of emergency

E-mail of person to notify in 
case of emergency

Permanent residence of person 
to notify in case of emergency 

(address, city/village, postal 
code, country)

Where do you currently live? in a house in an apartment
in a student house
Other (please specify)

Language ability English
Mother tongue

Other languages (please 
specify)

Where did you learn your 
second/third/fourth etc. 

language?

Do you have a driver's license? yes
no

Can you ride a bicycle? yes
no

Do you smoke? yes
no
sometimes

Do you drink alcohol? yes
no
sometimes

Do you use any substances that 
are usually illegal around the 

world (marijuana, ecstasy, etc.).
If yes, please specify

yes
no
Other, please specify.

Do you suffer from any 
allergies? If yes, please specify 

what kind of allergies.



Do you prefer a specific diet 
(vegetarian, vegan)? If yes, 

please specify.

no
yes (please specify)

Do you require any special diet 
or have any health related 

limitations?

no
yes (please specify)

Do you have any pets? If yes, 
please specify.

no
yes (please specify)

Do you plan to take your pets 
with you while on EVS in Local 

Development Agency?

no
yes

Do you play any instrument? If 
yes, please specify.

no
yes (please specify)

Do you plan to take your 
musical instrument with you 

while on EVS in Local 
Development Agency?

no
yes

Do you practice any sports? If 
yes, please specify what sport 

and for how long have you been 
practicing it.

Do you prefer to live in an 
apartment or a house while on 

EVS? Please specify why.

Do you mind sharing kitchen 
and bathroom with other 

renters in a house/apartment?

no
yes

Do you own a personal 
computer (laptop)?

no
yes

Are you willing to take your 
personal computer (laptop) 

while doing your EVS 
experience in LDA? 

no
yes

Do you mind working on your 
personal computer (laptop) 

while doing your EVS in LDA?

no
yes

Has the weather any influence 
on your work and inspiration? 

If yes, please specify how.

What inspires you the most?



Do you have any specific 
hobby? If yes, please specify.

no
yes (please specify)

Professional Background Information
How many months would you 

like to spend doing your 
voluntary service?

Please specify the exact period 
of time when you are willing to 
spend your EVS experience in 
Local Development Agency –

Struga.

Please specify how many hours 
are you willing to work in the 

office and how many days 
during the week?

How did you find out about 
Local Development Agency?

Why did you choose Local 
Development Agency as a host 

organization?

Which of the volunteer projects 
offered by us does interest you
most? Please specify the first, 

second and third choice (i.e. the 
reference from our website or
the EI reference from the EU 

database, if you found more 
interesting and appropriate 

projects):

Have you visited our official 
website or any of our social 

network official profiles? If yes, 
please specify what activities 

you find most interesting and 
why?

Do you have any previous 
practical or theoretical 

experience in any of the fields 
LDA covers with its activities? 

If yes, please specify. If not, 
how can you contribute in a 

better implementation of the
activities?



Do you have any further ideas 
on certain activities you may 

implement in LDA? If yes, 
please specify the type of 

activity, the needed materials
about the implementation, a 

description of the venue where 
these activities will be 

implemented, the period of 
time the implementation will 

take etc

Do you mind working with 
other EVS volunteers at the 
same time in the same office 

and on the same activities? If 
yes, please specify why.

Why do you wish to live a 
certain period of time in 

another European country 
different than your home?

What are your expectations 
from Local Development 

Agency?

What are your expectations 
from yourself while on EVS?

Why did you choose Macedonia 
to be your host country?

Please explain what did you do 
in your Sending Organization.

Have you ever faced any issues 
while implementing an 

activity? If yes, please specify 
the issue and the way you 

managed it.

What issues do you expect 
while spending your EVS in 

LDA?

What are your biggest concerns 
regarding the voluntary 

service?

How often do you visit your 
Sending Organization and how 

many hours do you spend 
there?



Name/Middle name and 
surname of a contact person in 

charge for your activities in 
your Sending Organization.

E-mail address of person in 
charge for your activities in 
your Sending Organization.

Contact phone/mobile of 
person in charge of your 

activities in your Sending 
Organization.

What are your career plans?

Are you willing to pursue all 
the needed documents for 

providing the visa in the closest 
Macedonian Embassy before 

your arrival in Macedonia? (I 
send you the list in attach 

together with this application).

Space for further remarks or 
comments:

Also, please attach: Curriculum vitae and Motivational letter, both in English 
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